
  

  

 

Husky Lima Refinery 

Turnaround Scoping Coordinator 

Job No. 00120625-20180324 

-          The Turnaround Scoping Coordinator is primarily responsible for developing and maintaining 
the Turnaround Scope.  This role will proactively gather and compile information from Refinery 
Inspection, Operations, Maintenance, Reliability Engineering, Project Engineering, Technical 
Support, Instrument and Electrical, and Rotating Equipment groups to produce a comprehensive 
Turnaround worklist and plan.  The position is responsible for maintaining security and accuracy of 
the worklist and maintaining the AWR process after scope freeze. 

Specific responsibilities will include: 

-          Leads scope development process by integrating information from PSM, Environmental, 
refinery Inspection, Operations, Maintenance, Reliability Engineering, Project Engineering, 
Technical Support, Instrument, Electrical and Rotating Equipment.   

-          Responsible for initiating the worklists, assigning individual line item numbers, and providing 
routine updates.   

-          Acts as a liaison between turnaround and operations groups to ensure the Turnaround 
worklists are all-inclusive and contain scope that can only be done during Turnarounds. 

-          Leads scope review meetings to ensure all parties understand the scope and responsibilities. 

-          Ensures and coordinates operation's development of blanklists as needed for all worklist line 
items. 

-          Determines scaffold and fresh air requirements. Considers whether equipment will need 
special preparation. 

-          Develops workbook for operators and supervisors which includes information about 
Turnaround items on their unit.   Includes safety, MSDS, timing, shutdown & startup procedures, 
and special procedures. 

-          Owns and maintains the Turnaround Additional Work Request (AWR) Process, ensuring all 
work that is added after scope freeze is identified and estimated prior to inclusion in the 
Turnaround scope 



Qualifications 

-          Experience with producing and/or reading engineering drawings such as plot plans, piping 
isometrics, instrument loop drawings, and P&ID's. 

-          Interpersonal communication and organizational skills. 

-          Proactive mindset to deliver Turnaround scope and planning 

-          Ability to work in a team environment dealing with people from various disciplines to achieve 
total Turnaround success. 

-          Minimum of ten years' experience in refinery or chemical plant operations, project coordination 
or maintenance. 

-          Demonstrates knowledge and experience with safe work practices in an oil refinery 
environment. 

-          Familiarity with SAP and knowledge of IPS is an asset 

-          Proficient with Primavera Project Planner 

-          Proficient with MS Excel 

  

For more information and to apply:  https://jobs.huskyenergy.com/job/lima/turnaround-scoping-
coordinator/579/8130755 

  

  

  

  

 

Husky Lima Refinery 

Manager, Reliability Inspection 

Job No. 00045808-20180510 

https://jobs.huskyenergy.com/job/lima/turnaround-scoping-coordinator/579/8130755
https://jobs.huskyenergy.com/job/lima/turnaround-scoping-coordinator/579/8130755


Description 

-          Designing, scheduling, executing, evaluating, and documenting inspections for various 
refinery equipment.  This position provides expertise and direction on code compliance and weld 
procedure qualification to capital projects and maintenance activities involving piping and pressure 
vessels constructed to various ASME Codes, including quality control of repairs.  This position 
provides leadership for the inspection group consisting of both Husky and Contract employees. 

Specific responsibilities will include:  

-          Provide leadership and direction to the Mechanical Integrity Team, including Husky & Contract 
Inspection personnel, establishing strategic direction and ensuring safe, high quality and timely 
inspection work is completed. 

-          Develop and implement programs to improve the reliability and safety of fixed equipment. 

-          Supervise and coordinate inspection, testing, design, alteration and repair of fixed equipment. 

-          Within the position’s established level of authority, develop and manage annual budget to 
achieve Business Unit objectives.  

-          Provide Business Unit leadership to effectively manage the Mechanical Integrity Team, 
maximize team effectiveness, and deliver on performance contracts. 

-          Ensure talent management and workforce planning activities are aligned with current 
strategies. 

-          Coach, develop and train staff, recognizing their expertise and contribution to the work of the 
Business Unit.  

-          Oversee the development and implementation of training and career development programs 
to ensure that they align with operational requirements and Husky’s strategic objectives. 

-          Provide ongoing feedback on performance informally through one on one mentoring and 
formally through PPRP reviews. 

-          Provide leadership during Lima's transition to a Risk-Based Inspection Program 

-          Provide historical and corrosion research, reporting, documentation, and repair 
recommendations. 

-          Provide fixed equipment design and repair expertise through research and repair 
recommendations consistent with applicable industry codes, standards and specifications. 

-          Responsible for root cause failure analysis of components including corrosion research, 
reporting, and supervision of metallurgical analysis. 



-          Develop and publish written reports on inspection findings and failure analysis (includes 
reviewing and editing inspection recommendations and reports for code and engineering 
compliance.) 

-          Keep abreast of the latest developments in Inspection Technology, Damage mechanisms, 
Industry trends, and issues in the petrochemical industry and apply those external learnings to the 
Mechanical integrity programs at the Lima Refinery. 

-          Maintain an efficient and safe work environment that provides leadership that fosters and 
promotes employees' participation. 

-          Responsible for following all safety policies and guidelines as established by Husky Energy 
and the LRC. 

-          Actively participate in monthly Safety Meetings. 

-          Participate in HAZOPS, MOC's and Incident Investigations. 

Qualifications 

-          Bachelor's Degree in Engineering preferred; or directly related experience and Inspection 
Certification may be considered in lieu of degree. 

-          Professional Certifications would be considered an asset: 

-          American Petroleum Institute (API) 510 Pressure Vessel Inspector Certificate 

-          American Petroleum Institute (API) 570 Piping Inspector Certificate 

-          American Petroleum Institute (API) 653 Tank Inspector Certification 

-          American Welding Society (AWS) Certified Welding Inspector 

-          Registered Professional Engineer 

-          Non-Destructive Evaluation (NDE) Level II Certificate in Penetrant Testing (PT) 

-          Non-Destructive Evaluation (NDE) Level II Certificate in Radiography Testing (RT) 

-          Non-Destructive Evaluation (NDE) Level II Certificate in Ultrasonic Testing (UT) 

-          Non-Destructive Evaluation (NDE) Level II Certificate in Magnetic Particle Testing (MT) 

-          Minimum of 10 years of experience in the inspection of fixed equipment and piping systems 
using API-510, API-570, and NBIC 



-          Minimum of 3 years of Supervisory Experience 

-          Five years of experience with repairs to ASME pressure vessels, boilers and shell and tube 
heat exchangers would be an asset 

-          Ability to isometrically sketch piping systems and understand process flow and P&ID's 

-          Ability to read and interpret engineering drawings 

-          Working knowledge of welding and fabrication techniques including heat treatment and 
material specifications and their applicability in petrochemical plants. (ASME Section IX and NDE 
requirements.) 

-          Refinery experience directly related to inspecting piping systems and experience in Refinery 
Turnaround(s) 

-          Strong working knowledge of oil and gas industry codes, standards and jurisdictional 
regulations (ASME, API) 

-          Proficient with PCMS and MS Office applications 

-          Proficiency SAP or other Business Enterprise Software would be an asset 

-          Analytical skills to identify key issues based on relevant data and provide appropriate 
solutions/recommendations 

-          Strong planning, scheduling and cost control skills 

-          Strong interpersonal, team building and communications skills to collaborate with the business 
unit and leadership team 

  

For more info and to apply:  https://jobs.huskyenergy.com/job/lima/mgr-reliability-inspection/579/8130754 

  

  

 

Nickles Bakery, Lima 

Maintenance Mechanic 

https://jobs.huskyenergy.com/job/lima/mgr-reliability-inspection/579/8130754


Candidates must possess: 

-          Basic mechanical skills 

-          Knowledge in industrial electrical control wiring 

-          Troubleshooting 

-          Experience with hydraulics, pneumatics, fabrication, welding 

-          Experience with power transmission and conveyor belts 

-          Knowledge of machine repair 

-          Must supply own tools 

-          Position offers competitive wages, full benefits package, pension, 401(k) 

  

Apply in person Mon-Fri, 8 am to 4 pm at 1950 N. Sugar Street, Lima 

  

  

 

Nickles Bakery, Lima 

Maintenance Technician Apprentice 

-          Work in industrial manufacturing environment to perform mechanical and electrical duties to 
keep machines and facilities in repair 

-          Qualified candidates will receive on-the-job, hands-on training while working full time 

-          Mechanical skills will be developed while working to keeping equipment and plant operations 
running efficiently 

-          Basic knowledge of mechanical skills, industrial electrical controls and wiring & 
troubleshooting, hydraulics, pneumatics, fabrication and welding are a PLUS for this apprenticeship 
program 

-          Must supply own tools 

https://maps.google.com/?q=1950+N.+Sugar+Street,+Lima&entry=gmail&source=g


-          Experience with power transmission and conveyor beneficial 

-          Knowledge of machine repair beneficial 

-          Position offers competitive wages, full benefits package, pension, 401(k) 

  

Apply in person Mon-Fri, 8 am to 4 pm at 1950 N. Sugar Street, Lima 

  

  

  

 

Trinity Highway Products, Lima 

Machine Operators 

-          Pay range $14.65 to $19.60 

  

Apply online at trinitycareers.com 

 

  

 

Innocor, Spencerville 

Maintenance Technician 

OMJ Reference #3638852 

  

-          This is an off shift including 2nd and 3rd shift position.  

https://maps.google.com/?q=1950+N.+Sugar+Street,+Lima&entry=gmail&source=g
http://trinitycareers.com/


-          Candidates must have 3-5 years of maintenance experience in a manufacturing environment, 
proficiency in electro-mechanical troubleshooting, repair and diagnostics. 

-          Must also be able to work independently and communicate effectively with the ability to carry 
out detailed oral or written instruction and be able to deal with problems involving multiple variables 
in continuously changing situations. 

  

To Apply: Visit www.OhioMeansJobs.com and search by reference number. 

Click “Get Started” in Search Jobs box 

Enter OMJ Reference # in Keywords box 

  

  

  

  

   

Honda Transmission, Russells Point 

Controls Engineer 

Job No. HTM 000081 

Position Core Role: 

-          Provide the Engineering and ES groups with electrical/controls support to maintain daily 
equipment run rates. 

-          Support AT New Model group with necessary equipment changes/improvements for new 
model launches. 

-          Support the AT Quality group with polk-a-yoke systems to ensure quality and provide 
countermeasure solutions for concern items. 

-          Design, assemble, install and commission turnkey automated systems for the AT department 
BOP projects. 

http://www.ohiomeansjobs.com/


Essential Function and Responsibilities: 

-          Experience with, but not limited to, programming of sequence and safety PLC's, HMI's, 
Motoman robots, Cognex/Keyence vision systems, servo positioning systems, VFD's, and RFID 
systems. 

-          Experience with multiple network platforms and various communication protocols. 

-          Experience with complete electrical and pneumatic design for automated systems. 

-          Understand SCCR calculation methods and applicable knowledge of NEC/NFPA and ANSI 
RIA standards. 

-          Able to perform all project aspects from electrical systems design/drawings, materials 
procurement, system wiring/assembly, programming and commissioning. 

Daily Tasks: 

-          Project work. 

-          Support ES with electrical and controls types of issues. 

-          Help support various AT groups to provide electrical/controls expertise. 

Required Knowledge, Skills and Abilities: 

-          Ability to design electrical controls systems including power, safety and controls from concept 
to finished drawing package. 

-          Experience with PLC programming utilizing function block and ladder logic techniques. 

-          Ability to configure control devices (PLC's, robots, vision systems, etc.) and integrate them 
into complex automated systems. 

-          Understanding of various communication protocols and network layers from simple I/O up 
through the enterprise level. 

-          Experienced at panel and field wiring. Basic understanding of pneumatic components and 
circuitry. 

Required Experience: 

-          Minimum of 2 years manufacturing experience in electrical/controls field and/or 2 years 
experience in systems integration field. 

Education Requirements:  B.S. in Electrical Engineering or 6 years equivalent experience 



  

For more information on this and other employment opportunities with Honda of America, visit  

http://www.honda.com/careers/find-a-job     Enter location or Job # in text box for position of 
interest 

  

  

  

 

Whirlpool Findlay 

Manufacturing Systems Engineer 

Job Responsibilities 

-          Lead development/enhancement of plant data collection, SCADA, and manufacturing 
execution systems 

-          Architect new technology solutions for improving plant processes and data analytics 

-          Oversee support/maintenance of system infrastructure, including virtual servers, storage, and 
networking 

-          Lead a small DevOps group of software developers and system technicians; advance the 
group’s skillset and capability 

-          Work effectively with your peers to share knowledge and leverage strengths 

-          Utilize excellent communication and documentation skills to transfer critical process and 
support knowledge to others 

Minimum Requirements 

-          .NET C# development experience in services and MVC/WebAPI 

-          HTML/JS development experience 

-          Microsoft SQL development experience 

-          Knowledge of Windows and Linux operating systems 

http://www.honda.com/careers/find-a-job


-          Knowledge of networks and communications 

-          Bachelor degree in Computer Science or an applicable Engineering/Technology field 

-          Proficient in problem-solving methods, analyzing data 

-          Passionate and driven about technology 

  

To apply: https://jobs.whirlpool.com/job/Findlay-Manufacturing-Systems-Engineer-OH-45840/452742700/  

  

  

  

 

Whirlpool Findlay 

Fabrication or Controls Engineer Lead 

-          The Fabrication or Controls Engineer will be accountable to acquire and manage the 
associated capital equipment for new products from conception through to formal production 
handoff at the selected manufacturing location of choice. 

-          As the CME Fabrication Engineer, you will be accountable for supporting new product 
integration by providing manufacturing expertise to each of the key functions. 

-          Working closely with primary North American manufacturing location to define capital 
purchases. 

-          Specifying through implementation and handoff of new equipment to manufacturing 
operations. 

-          Improving speed in which we deliver winning products to the marketplace. 

-          Ensuring that new manufacturing processes are flexible in design to accommodate long-range 
new product cadence plans with the intent of minimizing future capital requirements. 

-          Working closely with the Advanced Manufacturing Group to ensure that new processes are in 
compliance with the established Global Bill of Processes. 

-          Leading projects and special assignments as required. 

https://jobs.whirlpool.com/job/Findlay-Manufacturing-Systems-Engineer-OH-45840/452742700/


-          Lead a small group of engineers local and remote 

-          Set team goals and objectives as well as lead performance reviews and coaching 
performance 

-          Work with team on professional development and succession planning 

  

Minimum Qualifications: 

-          BS degree 

-          4+ years of manufacturing experience 

  

To apply: https://jobs.whirlpool.com/job/Findlay-Fabrication-or-Controls-Engineer-Lead-OH-
45840/470475000/ 

   

  

  

 

Cooper Tire, Findlay 

Warehouse Worker 

Req ID 28825 

Job specific duties include, but are not limited to: 

-          Driving a sit-down forklift most of the time during your 12 hour shift. 

-          Lifting / carrying tires weighing 50-75 pounds as needed. 

-          Lifting / carrying and safely exchanging propane tanks weighing 60 pounds. 

-          Operating a pallet jack, order picker and/or handheld mobile computer. 

Work Schedule:  

https://jobs.whirlpool.com/job/Findlay-Fabrication-or-Controls-Engineer-Lead-OH-45840/470475000/
https://jobs.whirlpool.com/job/Findlay-Fabrication-or-Controls-Engineer-Lead-OH-45840/470475000/


-          The Lake Cascades Distribution Center operates 24/7. Individuals work 12-hour shifts.  Must 
be able to work any shift (day or night) on a 2-2-3 continuous operation work schedule which will 
include Saturdays and Sundays (2 days on, 2 days off, 3 days on; on a repeating schedule with a 
three day weekend (off) every other week). 

Basic Qualifications: 

-          High School Diploma or an accredited G.E.D, documentation may be required. 

-          Must have a good, stable work record with at least one year of current continuous work history 
in a warehouse or distribution center environment. 

-          Must be able to pass a hair follicle drug test and background check. 

-          Must have on-the-job experience using one or more of the following pieces of equipment: 
forklift, order picker, handheld mobile computer. 

Pay & Benefits: 

-          Starting pay is $15.03 per hour. After six months of service pay increases to $15.55 per hour.   

-          After one year of service pay increases to $16.07 per hour. 

  

For more information and to apply:  https://career4.successfactors.com/career?company=cooper 

Enter Findlay in Location box 

Select desired job and click Apply 

  

  

 

Cooper Tire, Findlay 

Production Worker – Direct Hire 

Req ID 28831 

https://career4.successfactors.com/career?company=cooper


-          The production worker operates manufacturing equipment and / or performs manual laborer 
work that supplies raw materials, products or service associated with the manufacture and 
processing of tires and tire components. 

Job specific details include, but are not limited to: 

-          Lifting / carrying product weighing 50-75 pounds. 

-          Walking or standing, may also include stooping and crouching around conveyors and / or 
around production equipment. 

-          Operating and monitoring manufacturing equipment / line, removing or shifting materials and / 
or finished product as necessary to facilitate proper flow and machine operation. 

-          Operating manufacturing equipment efficiently and safely. 

-          Ensuring product quality. 

-          Expediting repairs to line and working with maintenance as necessary. 

-          Cleaning equipment and area during and after shift. 

-          Keeping daily records of down time and machine operations. 

 Work Schedule: 

-          The Findlay plant operates 24/7. Individuals work 12-hour shifts.  Must be able to work any 
shift (day or night) on a 2-2-3 continuous operation work schedule which will include Saturdays and 
Sundays (2 days on, 2 days off, 3 days on; on a repeating schedule with a three day weekend (off) 
every other week). 

Basic Qualifications: 

-          High School Diploma or an accredited G.E.D. 

-          A good, stable work record and one year of current work history. 

-          Must be able to pass a hair follicle drug test and background check. 

-          Ability to work any shift (day or night) on a 2-2-3 continuous operation work schedule which 
will include Saturdays and Sundays. 

Pay & Benefits: 

Starting pay is $15.45 with opportunities for higher earning potential with piecework pay. 



Direct hire  

  

For more information and to apply:  https://career4.successfactors.com/career?company=cooper 

Enter Findlay in Location box 

Select desired job and click Apply 

  

  

 

Cooper Tire, Findlay 

Manufacturing Technician 

Req ID 28725 

Responsibilities: 

-          Installs sipes and venting 

-          Inspects molds to ensure quality 

-          Maintains systems and ensures facility cleanliness 

-          Inspects equipment, facility and conducts activities in a safe manner in compliance with work 
regulations 

-          Maintains and/or develops working knowledge of computer applications 

-          Obtains approval on discrepancies 

-          Follows specific processes and procedures to maximize the efficiencies of the business 

-          Produces quality and timely data, with minimal level of initial analysis 

-          Contributes to projects in pulling data 

-          Responsible for routine functions of the department 

https://career4.successfactors.com/career?company=cooper


  

Requirements: 

-          This position requires a high school diploma. 

-          Able to work a 12 hours shift on a 2-2-3 schedule 

-          Able to work nights and overtime 

Skills Required: 

-          Mechanical aptitude 

-          General knowledge of computers, machines, and inspection 

-          Ability to understand defined technical processes 

-          Knowledgeable and attentive to safety requirements 

-          Ability to read and understand technical drawings 

-          General knowledge of specific equipment, theory and practice 

-          Familiar with specific tools in area 

-          Proficient in the execution of methods and procedures 

-          Detail oriented with good interpersonal skills 

-          Ability to establish priorities and meet individual deadlines 

-          Work requires continual attention to detail 

-          Ability to work in fast-paced environment with demonstrated ability to juggle multiple tasks and 
demands 

Preferred Requirements: 

-          Working towards an Associates Degree or certification is preferred 

-          2 years experience, desired 

-          Previous experience operating CNC machining equipment and CAM programming or 
completed trade school or an apprenticeship in machining 



-          Welding experience is desired 

  

For more information and to apply:  https://career4.successfactors.com/career?company=cooper 

Enter Findlay in Location box 

Select desired job and click Apply 

  

  

  

 

Unverferth Manufacturing, Kalida & Delphos 

CNC Operators (Kalida) 

Welders 

Assemblers 

-          HS diploma or GED 

-          3 or more years of manufacturing experience 

-          Solid attendance record 

-          Candidates should be able to work flexible assignments and work schedules 

-          Competitive wage and benefit package, including employer-paid health insurance, profit 
sharing and 401(k) 

  

Apply in person at either facility: 

Kalida - 601 Broad Street 

Delphos - 24399 Jennings Road 

https://career4.successfactors.com/career?company=cooper


Or email to careers@unverferth.com with your name and address and an application will be mailed to 
you. 

  

 

Crown Equipment, New Knoxville 

Plastic Operator – 2nd shift 

Job No. 50644 

Responsibilities: 

-          Operate all injection molding machines and rotate as needed. 

-          Perform hand painting on parts. 

-          Perform pre-post checks on all parts. 

-          Assemble parts with glue. 

-          Load material into machine hoppers. 

Qualifications: 

-          Entry Level - Will Train. 

-          Be able to perform basic math. 

-          Use hand held gauges and hand tools as necessary. 

-          High school diploma or equivalent. 

  

To apply: www.crown.jobs  

Select location and click desired position 

  

  

http://www.crown.jobs/


 

Crown Equipment, New Bremen 

Lathe Operator – 2nd shift 

Job No. 50750 

Responsibilities: 

-          Set up, adjust, and operate automatic and CNC lathes. 

-          Change tooling as needed. 

-          Operate 1 or 2 machines by self or up to 3 machines with the help of another operator. 

-          Help solve machining problems related to your machine. 

-          Inspect parts per print specifications. 

-          Help train and assist new operators. 

-          Able to read and change CNC programs. 

-          Comply with all applicable occupational Environmental, Health, and Safety standards, as well 
as Crown’s safety rules and regulations for each task performed. 

Qualifications:  This position requires a high school diploma or equivalent. 

  

To apply: www.crown.jobs  

Select location and click desired position 

  

  

 

Crown Equipment, New Bremen 

Software Quality Analyst I 

http://www.crown.jobs/


Job No. 50679 

Job Responsibilities: 

-          The Software Quality Analyst I is a critical role within the Insite agile based cloud development 
team chartered to develop and deploy new global fleet and service management products.  The 
Software 

-          Quality Analyst I applies the principles and practices of software quality assurance throughout 
the software development life cycle.  This includes developing practices and procedures to identify 
problems or deficiencies in Insite software products and preparing requirements, specifications, 
and test suites for Insite software applications.  The Software Quality Analyst I works under close 
supervision and works closely with the Insite application development staff. 

Minimum Qualifications: 

-          Associate degree, preferably in Computer Science or Information Systems 

-          0-2 years of experience in quality assurance methodologies or software testing 

-          Good written, verbal, analytical, and interpersonal skills 

-          Automated testing experience preferred 

-          Ability to occasionally travel with overnight stays 

-          Valid driver's license and good driving record 

  

To apply: www.crown.jobs  

Select location and click desired position 

  

  

 

Crown Equipment, Celina 

Production Support – 3rd shift 

Job No. 50732 

http://www.crown.jobs/


Job Responsibilities: 

-          Load and unload parts properly onto conveyor, robot and/or machine with assistance of a lift 
truck or hoist (as necessary). 

-          Manually load and unload parts onto conveyor, robot and/or machine. 

-          Change tooling and/or fixtures and make minor adjustments as necessary. 

-          Perform pre and post checks. 

-          Inspect parts to print specifications. 

-          Perform daily lift truck and hoist pre-operational safety checks. 

-          Assist department employees in their task as necessary 

Qualifications: 

-          Must be able to read, understand drawings and production order travelers. 

-          Must be able to listen, communicate and understand verbal instructions. 

-          Must understand basic math, including decimals. 

-          Must be able to remember, reason and analyze. 

-          High School diploma or equivalent 

  

To apply: www.crown.jobs  

Select location and click desired position 

  

  

 

Crown Equipment, Celina 

Mill Operator CNC – 3rd shift 

http://www.crown.jobs/


Job No. 50731 

Responsibilities: 

-          Set up, adjust, and operate CNC horizontal and vertical mills to machine parts to print 
specifications. 

-          Deburr parts as needed. 

-          Operate multiple machines at a time as necessary. 

-          Inspect parts per print specifications. 

-          Change tooling as required. 

-          Clean machine and work area (includes metal shavings) as required. 

-          Perform basic preventive maintenance on the machines. 

-          Train and assist other operators. 

Qualifications: 

-          Frequent lifting and carrying 

-          Must be able to safely work in areas of lift truck traffic 

-          Basic math, knowledge of CNC programming, reason, and analyze. 

-          Verniers, micrometer, wrenches, deburring tools, miscellaneous gages, drill press, hoist, metal 
chip conveyor, ear plugs, safety shoes, and safety glasses. 

-          High School Diploma or equivalent 

  

To apply: www.crown.jobs  

Select location and click desired position 

  

  

  

http://www.crown.jobs/


 

Crown Equipment, Celina 

Lathe Operator CNC – 2nd shift 

Job No. 50729 

Responsibilities:  

-          Set-up, adjust, and operate CNC lathes to produce parts to print specifications. 

-          Operate multiple lathes at the same time. 

-          Operate shop floor control. 

-          Make adjustments to tooling as needed. 

-          Inspect parts per print specifications. 

-          Comply with all applicable occupational Environmental, Health, and Safety standards, as well 
as Crown’s safety rules and regulations for each task performed. 

Qualifications: 

-          Read, blueprints, understand basic math (including fractions and decimals), convert between 
metric and English, some knowledge of CNC programming, remember, reason, and analyze. 

-          Micrometers, verniers, miscellaneous gages, tape measure, hand grinder, burr knife, bore 
gages, sanders, hoists, ear plugs, safety shoes, and safety glasses.  

-          High School Diploma or equivalent 

  

To apply: www.crown.jobs  

Select location and click desired position 

  

 

Crown Equipment, Celina 

http://www.crown.jobs/


Saw Op – 2nd shift 

Job No. 50697 

Responsibilities: 

-          Set-up, adjust and operate saws along with other related machines to cut bar stock to print 
specifications. 

-          Place cut to length parts in proper locations such as in pans, in tubs, and on pallets. 

-          Set-up, adjust and operate a beveler as required. 

-          Change  saw blade and beveler wheel as required. 

-          Use hand grinder and belt sander as needed. 

  

To apply: www.crown.jobs  

Select location and click desired position 

  

  

 

Setex, St. Marys 

Assembly Technicians - 2nd shift 

-         Candidates must possess HS diploma or GED 

-         Eye for quality 

-         Excellent attendance record 

-         Able to work in team environment 

-         We offer highly competitive wages & benefit package that includes medical insurance, dental 

insurance, vision insurance, bonuses, shift premiums, 401(k), tuition reimbursement, paid uniforms 

http://www.crown.jobs/


  

Apply in person at 1111 McKinley Road, St Marys. 

On-the-spot interviews if minimum criteria met Wednesday, May 23, 9 am to 3 pm 

  

  

  

 

CAPT, Celina 

Production Associates – 2nd & 3rd shifts 

Qualifications: 

-          High School diploma or GED 

-          Ability to work all shifts (shift could potentially change during shift realignment) 

-          Excellent attendance record and safety attitude 

-          Willingness to work overtime on short notice, including weekends 

-          Desire to contribute as an active team member 

-          Good communication skills 

Compensation: 

-          Starting wage is $15.70 per hour progressing every three months to $18.50 per hour within 24 
months.  2nd and 3rd shift earn an additional $.30 shift differential. 

Benefit package includes: Very Low Cost Medical, Dental, Vision and Prescription. We also have Health 
Club Membership, Company Paid Life Insurance with Supplemental Option, Holiday Pay, Vacation Pay 
Earned Monthly, Company Paid Short and Long Term Disability, Two Weeks Paid Shutdown, Birthday Off 
with Pay, Company Paid Uniforms, Safety Boot Reimbursement, 401(k) With Company Match, Defined 
Pension Plan, Tuition Payment Program for Family, Employee Assistance Program, and Bonus program. 

  



To apply: Complete and application and return to CAPT at 7059 Staeger Road, Celina, OH  45822. 
Applications available at CAPT or on our website: http://www.capt-celina.com/career_opportunities. 

  

  

 

CAPT, Celina 

Maintenance Technician 

Qualifications: 

-          A work history of mechanical and electrical maintenance in a manufacturing environment 

-          Ability to work and communicate within a Team environment 

-          Experience in casting or machining helpful but not required 

-          Availability to work any shift. This position is primarily on second shift but will involve covering 
first and third shift as needed. 

Responsibilities: 

-          Maintenance of equipment- electrical/mechanical 

-          Installation, troubleshooting and repair of equipment 

-          Preventative maintenance 

Our compensation package includes: Competitive Pay, Training program for Advancement, Shift 
premiums and Bonus, Low cost Insurance, Tuition Payment. 

Education Level: High School 
Career Level: Mid-Level 

  

To apply: Complete and application and return to CAPT at 7059 Staeger Road, Celina, OH  45822. 
Applications available at CAPT or on our website: http://www.capt-celina.com/career_opportunities. 

  

  

http://www.capt-celina.com/career_opportunities.
http://www.capt-celina.com/career_opportunities.


  

 

AAP, St. Marys 

Maintenance/Machine Repair 

-          Install, troubleshoot, and repair machinery/equipment.  

-          Two (2) years of multi-trade experience with industrial electrical, mechanical, hydraulics, and 
pneumatics, and robotics required.  

-          High school diploma or equivalent and related technical training required. 

  

To apply: www.aapstmarys.com 

  

  

  

 

Omni Manufacturing, St. Marys 

Welder 

-          Welder to cut and join metals and other materials at our facilities 

-          Operate appropriate equipment to put together mechanical structures or parts with a great 
deal of precision. 

-          Job is important as it provides support to production.  

-          Must be competent in using potentially dangerous equipment following all safety precautions. 

-          The ideal candidate will also have a steady hand and great attention to detail. Knowledge of 
different kinds of metal and their properties is essential. 

Responsibilities 

http://www.aapstmarys.com/


-          Read blueprints and drawings and take or read measurements to plan layout and procedures 

-          Determine the appropriate welding equipment or method based on requirements 

-          Set up components for welding according to specifications (e.g. cut material with powered 
saws to match measurements) 

-          Operate angle grinders to prepare the parts that must be welded 

-          Align components using, fixtures,  calipers, rulers etc. and clamp pieces 

-          Weld components using manual or semi-automatic welding equipment in various positions 
(vertical, horizontal or overhead) 

-          Repair machinery and other components by welding pieces and filling gaps 

-          Test and inspect welded surfaces and structure to discover flaws 

-          Maintain equipment in a condition that does not compromise safety 

Experience/Certification Required: 

-          Proven experience as welder 

-          Experience using a variety of welding equipment and procedures (GMAW & GTAW.) 

-          Experience in using electrical or manual tools (saws, squares, calipers etc.) 

-          Ability to read and interpret technical documents and drawings 

-          Knowledge of relative safety standards and willingness to use protective clothing (face-shield, 
gloves etc.) 

-          Deftness and attention to detail 

-          Successful completion of a relevant apprenticeship program is required 

-          Professional Certification (e.g. an AWS welding certificate) will be a plus 

Education Level: High School 
 
To apply: In person, or mail resume to 901 McKinley Road, PO Box 179, St. Marys, OH  45885 

Or email resume to: hr@omnimfg.com 

  

mailto:hr@omnimfg.com


  

  

 

Omni Manufacturing, St. Marys 

Painter/Powder Room Technician 

-          Responsible for powder coating parts to company supplied prints. 

ESSENTIAL FUNCTIONS: 

-          Adjust oven temperature to accommodate various line speed.  

-          Set up and checks water chemical balances in a wash system.  

-          Adjust powder flow and forward air pressures to ensure spec millage and gloss are retained.  

-          Maintain quality standards and line performances as set forth by Supervisor.  

-          Responsible for following quality system controls (ISO9001).  

-          Maintain attendance as required by company policy. 

-          Work all assigned overtime.   

-          Maintain housekeeping in his/her work area.  

Experience/Certification Required: 

-          Good knowledge of coating various types of powders.  3 years Powder Coating experience or 
2 year Technical Degree in Powder Coating.  

-          Forklift license. 

-          Knowledge of manufacturing environment, measuring device,  safety requirements, and 
quality requirements. 

Education Level: Associate's Degree 
Career Level: Experienced 

To apply: In person, or mail resume to 901 McKinley Road, PO Box 179, St. Marys, OH  45885 

Or email resume to: hr@omnimfg.com 

mailto:hr@omnimfg.com


  

  

  

 

Industrial Machining Services, Fort Loramie 

Controls/Electrical Engineer 

-          3 – 5 years of experience in design and programming of automated manufacturing cells. 
Demonstrated programming knowledge of one or more the following control platforms (Allen 
Bradley, Mitsubishi, Omron) willingness to learn additional due to project needs. 

-          Demonstrated programming knowledge of one or more of the following robotic platforms 
(Yaskawa, Fanuc, ABB) with the willingness to learn additional due to project needs. 

-          Design of control systems, safety systems, and panel layouts to applicable codes and 
customer specifications. 

-          Support installations into customer plants as needed. 

-          Competent in AutoCad 3D and Microsoft Office. 

-          Overnight travel requirements less than 10%. 

Experience/Certification Required: 

-          Associate Degree but not necessary if you have the skills needed for this position. 

  

To apply: Please send email: hr@ims-spi.com 

  

  

  

 

Health Care Products, Coldwater 

mailto:hr@ims-spi.com


Data Entry/Shipping Clerk 

Experience/Certification Required: 

-          Data entry experience required 

-          Planning, organizational, and time management skills 

-          Customer service skills required 

-          Ability to work independently and as a team 

-          Ability to be self-motivated 

-          Written and verbal communication skills 

-          Proficient computer skills 

-          Accuracy is critical 

-          Knowledge of Made2Manage software is a plus 

Education Level: Associate's Degree 

To apply: Online http://www.hcp3.com/contact-us.html  

Or in person at 410 Nisco Street, Coldwater 

  

  

  

 

Midwest Composites, Wapakoneta 

General Labor 

-          Several positions open for general laborers. 

-          Job requires lifting up to 40 lbs, ability to follow directions, utilize small hand tools, and work 
four 10-hour shifts (M-TH) per week.  

http://www.hcp3.com/contact-us.html


Experience/Certification Required: 

-          No experience required. We are willing to train the right, motivated individuals who possess a 
good work ethic, excellent attendance, and willingness to grow with the company. 

Salary/Benefits:  Starting wage at $10/hour. Paid vacation and profit sharing available. 

Education Level: High School 

To apply: Email resume to admin@mwcomposite.com  

  

  

 

King’s Command Foods, Versailles 

Process Worker 

-          Sort through RTE and Raw product as it comes down conveyor 

-          Separate any defective product and remove it from processing.  

-          Employee will remove box from stack (or rack), line box for finished product, place appropriate 
count (or weight) of product into lined box 

-          Close box if applicable and place on box conveyor.  

-          Set up work are for personal comfort. 

-          Sort out any product that does not meet customer specifications. 

-          Remove box from stack or rack. 

-          Line box with poly bag (when applicable). 

-          Pack box with appropriate count or weight. 

-          Close filled box and place on box conveyor. 

-          Report any issues or concerns to Line Lead. 

Experience/Certification Required:  Entry level factory experience  

mailto:admin@mwcomposite.com


Education Level: High School 
 
To apply: http://www.americanfoodsgroup.com 

  

  

  

 

King’s Command Foods, Versailles 

Shipping & Receiving – 2nd shift 

-          Oversee operations to provide for day-to-day control of assigned department activities 
according to prescribed schedules, priorities, production flow, and processing specifications to 
ensure production efficiencies are met hourly. 

-          Evaluate department work performance and take corrective action. 

-          Maintain minimal production down time and solutions to reduce downtime. 

-          Checking products as they are being loaded for any damage/leakage to the boxes or totes. 

-          Oversee the moving of production inbound and outbound. 

-          Communicate with other departments to move orders out the door in a timely manner. 

-          Complete required paperwork (i.e. Forklift and Walker sheet). 

-          Ensure food safety and security of all inbound and outbound trailers (all trailers with raw, 
finished product and packaging material should be sealed while in the shipping yard). 

-          Ensure the integrity of the incoming and outgoing trailers. 

-          Manage the rotation of the inbound and outbound trailers. 

-          Ensure all billing paperwork is delivered to the appropriate office employees. 

-          Ability to lift 60 lbs. 

Experience/Certification Required: 

-          2-3 years Manufacturing experience 

http://www.americanfoodsgroup.com/


-          Tow Motor experience 

Education Level: High School 

To apply: http://www.americanfoodsgroup.com 

  

  

 

Fairborn USA, Upper Sandusky 

Mechanical Engineer 

-          This position is responsible for designing and processing orders with varying complexity using 
AutoCAD. 

-          The position will also be responsible for ordering materials used for production of the product 
and assisting production, sales and other engineers in other tasks and projects. 

Requirements: 

-          Associate degree or higher – Mechanical Engineering (Preferred) 

-          Familiarity with AutoCAD and Microsoft Office required 

-          Ability to manage time and details 

-          Good verbal and written communication skills – interfaces with customers and shop 
personnel, documents equipment and process 

-          Experience in manufacturing a plus 

Benefits: 

Health Insurance and prescription card 

Life insurance policy 

Short term disability plan 

401 K with company matching 

Paid Vacation 

http://www.americanfoodsgroup.com/


Paid Holidays 

  

To apply:  Please send resumes to Nick Duncum: duncumn@FAIRBORNUSA.COM 

  

  

  

     

Molten North America, Findlay (Act-I Staffing) 

Production Associates 

-          Immediate openings 

-          MUST have a High School Diploma or GED. 

-          MUST be able to pass pre-employment screening. 

-          Interviews are being scheduled for Tuesday, 5/22!! 

  

Please stop in our office at 2017 Tiffin Avenue to complete an application from 9am – 3pm Monday 
through Friday Or give us a call at 419.423.0713 

  

  

 

http://duncumn@fairbornusa.com/

